



TAX COLLECTOR
 DIVISION OF THE DEPARTMENT OF FINANCE

ROY GIVEN, CPA
 DIRECTOR OF FINANCE

CRISTINE ALILOVICH, ASSISTANT

**REPORT OF PROPERTY SOLD AT PUBLIC AUCTION
 ON AUGUST 13, 2014**

ITEM NO.	ASSESSOR'S PARCEL NO.	FISCAL YEAR OF DEFAULT	DEFAULT NO.	LAST ASSESSEE	MINIMUM BID	SOLD FOR
3386	001-191-16	2005	12063	COX, JOSEPH H	\$19,500.00	No Bid
3387	003-052-20	2008	17246	PHAM, CHAU N	\$28,700.00	No Bid
3391	013-310-27	2008	17533	SHIEL, TONY	\$5,300.00	No Bid
3392	021-054-22	2005	12342	JEGEN, JERRY	\$13,500.00	\$15,100.00
3395	043-163-05	2008	17829	JOHNSTON, DAMIAN	\$15,100.00	\$20,000.00
3398	047-083-14	2007	15836	COOPERSMITH, JOEL	\$16,900.00	No Bid
3408	059-151-34	1998	892	VELLA, SAM	\$18,100.00	No Bid
3410	112-273-12	2006	14297	SCOGGINS, GILBERT	\$4,200.00	\$4,200.00
3412	132-132-16	2006	14368	HANSEN, NIELS A TR & HANSEN, DOROTHY L TR	\$4,900.00	No Bid
3415	153-162-40	2008	18600	FLORES, MARGARITA	\$4,300.00	No Bid
3416	155-161-20	2008	18617	KKG CONSOLIDATED LLC	\$10,400.00	No Bid
3424	169-041-30	2006	14747	TETREAUULT, JOYCE L	\$14,400.00	No Bid
3426	169-231-05	2008	18853	SUVA, DAN MENDOZA, NELSIE D	\$23,900.00	No Bid
3427	169-241-05	2003	10179	PENNER, OMAR A & ESTATE OF PENNER, EVELYN L ESTATE OF	\$28,000.00	No Bid
3428	169-243-01	2003	10183	PENNER, OMAR A & ESTATE OF PENNER, EVELYN L ESTATE OF	\$35,600.00	No Bid
3429	169-321-10	2007	16684	NELDER FAMILY TRUST	\$12,500.00	No Bid
3430	170-082-06	2007	16689	TYSON, KRISS R	\$8,200.00	No Bid
3437	180-241-23	1998	1859	MC MAHAN, DOROTHEA EST OF	\$12,200.00	No Bid
3438	180-333-05	2003	10301	ISAAC, TIMOTHY	\$61,200.00	No Bid
3440	190-041-15	2007	16888	SETO, VIOLETTE H TR ETAL SETO, FRANK W S TR ETAL	\$8,700.00	\$13,400.00
3441	190-042-25	2005	13203	SHAPIRO, JOSEPH A & MAXINE A	\$9,100.00	\$9,100.00
3442	190-191-18	2008	19050	GRANGER, WALTER B	\$6,600.00	No Bid
3445	191-022-04	2005	13214	LIGHTFOOT, LELAND B EST OF & LIGHTFOOT, LYNN E EST OF	\$11,700.00	No Bid
3446	191-122-13	2005	13221	EVANS, KENNETH & CECELIA D	\$11,500.00	\$150,000.00
3447	191-241-24	2003	10346	YIM, TUNG	\$14,500.00	No Bid
3448	193-172-15	2005	13252	TACHERRA, ERNEST J	\$11,800.00	\$20,600.00
3450	200-200-18	2008	19119	QUAN, PATRICIA A	\$1,500.00	No Bid

Requests for accommodations may be made by calling (415) 473-4381 (Voice/TTY), 711 for California Relay Service or e-mail at disabilityaccess@marincounty.org. Copies of documents are available in alternative formats, upon request.